
Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays,
Poetics (Border Lines)

Kurt Schwitters

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0877228949
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0877228949
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0877228949


Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays, Poetics
(Border Lines)

Kurt Schwitters

Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays, Poetics (Border Lines) Kurt Schwitters
Although Kurt Schwitters (1887-1948) is increasingly recognized as one of the great visual artists of the
twentieth century—a recognition reconfirmed in 1985 by a highly acclaimed retrospective at New York's
Museum of Modern Art—his achievements as one of the major poets and theorists of Modernism have not
received the same degree of attention. This collection of Schwitters' literary work, presented by two
American poets of international standing, brings the vast range and unique genius of his writings to English-
language audiences for the first time.

Coining the word "Merz" to identify his one-man version of Dadism, Schwitters sought to "erase the
boundaries between the arts" and to emphasize the reciprocal relationship of his visual and verbal works.
Schwitters worked with and developed more new forms and genres than almost any poet of his time. The
wide sweep and inventiveness of his literary output—essays, plays, fiction, manifestos, as well as
poetry—reflect or prefigure movements such as expressionism, surrealism, sound-texts, concrete poetry,
performance art, and language poetry.

To present Schwitters' astounding range, the poet-translators of this volume have selected poems, "proses,"
performance pieces, and manifestos; included complete major works, such as "Augusta Bolte" and "Ur
Sonata"; offered selections from Schwitters' plays; and provided a sampler of the collaged and word-filled
paintings (some in full color).
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From reader reviews:

Preston Sloan:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this
Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays, Poetics (Border Lines).

James Lindberg:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you
can spent the whole day to reading a publication. The book Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays,
Poetics (Border Lines) it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We
were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to develop this book
you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not
very costly but this book features high quality.

Jonathan McLean:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not just a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book you have
read will be Poems, Performance Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays, Poetics (Border Lines).

Michael Aldrich:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a book
you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact book
has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you
have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want
to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The Poems, Performance
Pieces, Proses (Sic), Plays, Poetics (Border Lines) will give you a new experience in reading a book.
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