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This book explores the Broadway legacy of choreographer Agnes de Mille, from the 1940s through the
1960s. Six musicals are discussed in depth - Oklahoma!, One Touch of Venus, Bloomer Girl, Carousel,
Brigadoon, and Allegro. Oklahoma!, Carousel, and Brigadoon were de Mille's most influential and lucrative
Broadway works. The other three shows exemplify aspects of her legacy that have not been fully examined,
including the impact of her ideas on some of the composers with whom she worked; her ability to
incorporate a previously conceived work into the context of a Broadway show; and her trailblazing foray into
the role of choreographer/director. Each chapter emphasizes de Mille's unique contributions to the original
productions.

Several themes emerge in looking closely at de Mille's Broadway repertoire. Character development
remained at the heart of her theatrical work work. She often took minor characters, represented with minimal
or no dialogue, and fleshed out their stories. These stories added a layer of meaning that resulted in more
complex productions. Sometimes, de Mille's stories were different from the stories her collaborators wanted
to tell, which caused many conflicts. Because her unique ideas often got woven into the fabric of her
musicals, de Mille saw her choreography as an authorship. She felt she should be given the same rights as the
librettist and the composer. De Mille's work as an activist is an aspect of her legacy that has largely been
overlooked. She contributed to revisions in dance copyright law and was a founding member of the Stage
Directors and Choreographers Society, a theatrical union that protects the rights of directors and
choreographers. Her contention that choreographers are authors who have their own stories to tell offers a
new way of understanding the Broadway musical.
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From reader reviews:

Arthur Pascual:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Agnes de Mille: Telling Stories in Broadway
Dance (Broadway Legacies) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you
can know about every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you
bored. It's not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal
book with you?

Kathryn Richardson:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yeah,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. In your case
who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Agnes de Mille: Telling Stories in Broadway Dance
(Broadway Legacies) book as beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater
than just a book.

Michael Herndon:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you
want really feel happy read one using theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Agnes de
Mille: Telling Stories in Broadway Dance (Broadway Legacies) is kind of book which is giving the reader
unstable experience.

Lynnette Jennings:

The book untitled Agnes de Mille: Telling Stories in Broadway Dance (Broadway Legacies) is the
publication that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown
to you. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
copy writer was did a lot of study when write the book, so the information that they share to you is
absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of Agnes de Mille: Telling Stories in Broadway
Dance (Broadway Legacies) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.
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