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Trying to understand the men in gray and the reasons that led to the War Between the States have been a
favorite for historians and novices when reviewing this period of our history. Reverend Robert Catlett Cave
wrote The Men in Gray in 1911 to help explain the Southern viewpoint on the conflict. At the unveiling of
the monument to the Confederate Sailors and Soldiers of the Southern Confederacy in Libby Park,
Richmond, Virginia, his oration sparked a controversy that led to the writing and explanation contained in
this book.

Most books about the War Between the States are about battles, campaigns, strategies, tactics, personalities,
and military activities. In contrast, Robert Cave has fairly and superbly presented the South’s side of the
causes of this war. His purpose was to give everyone a truer and more just conception of the South’s
motives, aims, lofty patriotism, and unwavering devotion to principle and constitutional law. Readers will
find his purpose and analysis have been well served in this outstanding treatise about a very controversial
subject.
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Kim:

The book Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the good thing like a book Defending the Southern
Confederacy: The Men in Gray? A number of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim in
which book can give many information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with
your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you are able to
share all of these. Book Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray has simple shape
nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by
open up and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Megan Fairbanks:

Beside this kind of Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray in your phone, it might give you
a way to get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might got here
is fresh in the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow small town. It is
good thing to have Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray because this book offers to you
personally readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come
on, that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable,
similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from
at this point!

Frederick Avelar:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books.
One of several books in the top listing in your reading list is Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men
in Gray. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious
person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Patsy Locke:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. By the book Defending the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray we can have more advantage.
Don't someone to be creative people? To get creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the
best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life at this time book Defending
the Southern Confederacy: The Men in Gray. You can more pleasing than now.
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