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Man in Focus: A gallery of men from photography’s maestro

“The way men are seen in photography, in fashion, and the way that men look at pictures of themselves has
changed in recent years. It is a subject that has come into focus: The masculine image, a man’s personal
style, changing attitudes to the male face and body.”
– Mario Testino

From Rio to London, Cusco to Seville, Mario Testino is renowned for his free-spirited chronicles of dress
and demeanor. In SIR, his largest book to-date, the influential photographer presents over 300 photographs
in his search to define the allure of men.

Featuring an essay by Pierre Borhan, an interview with Patrick Kinmonth, and many previously
unpublished works from Testino’s archive of thousands, this book traces the evolution of male identity over
the past three decades. Costume, tradition, gender play, portraiture, photojournalism, and fashion collide as
Testino observes masculinity in all its modern manifestations: through the dandy and the gentleman, the
macho and the fey, the world-famous face to the unknown passerby.

Every photograph represents a unique point of view, and a new visual connection between photographer and
sitter. With Josh Hartnett for VMAN (2005), Testino evokes the fall of Helmut Berger in the abyss of
Luchino Visconti’s The Damned. Studies of Brad Pitt, George Clooney, Jude Law and Colin Firth are as
candid as they are curious. David Beckham, David Bowie, Mick Jagger and Keith Richards feature for
the courage they have taken in redefining male identity. Through a kaleidoscope of guises, these portraits
define a period in which men’s changing role, style and appearance has never escaped Testino’s eye and
impeccable intuition.
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From reader reviews:

Lidia Hill:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this Mario Testino: SIR book since this
book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred percent guarantees
there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Betty Casas:

The knowledge that you get from Mario Testino: SIR is the more deep you searching the information that
hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
know but Mario Testino: SIR giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific
way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this book is well-known
enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then
can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
particular Mario Testino: SIR instantly.

Thomas Tritt:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what
types of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in
addition to soon. The Mario Testino: SIR offer you a new experience in studying a book.

Greg Christenson:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Mario Testino: SIR can be the
response, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading
in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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