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Geared toward undergraduate and graduate students, this text extends applications of the finite element
method from linear problems in elastic structures to a broad class of practical, nonlinear problems in
continuum mechanics. It treats both theory and applications from a general and unifying point of view.
The text reviews the thermomechanical principles of continuous media and the properties of the finite
element method, and then brings them together to produce discrete physical models of nonlinear continua.
The mathematical properties of these models are analyzed, along with the numerical solution of the
equations governing the discrete model. Though the theory and methods are sufficiently general to be
applied to any nonlinear problem, emphasis has been placed on problems in finite elasticity, viscoelasticity,
heat conduction, and thermoviscoelasticity. Problems in rarefied gas dynamics and nonlinear partial
differential equations are also examined.
Other topics include topological properties of finite element models, applications to linear and nonlinear
boundary value problems, and discrete models of nonlinear thermomechanical behavior of dissipative media.
This comprehensive text is valuable not only to students of structural analysis and continuum mechanics but
also to professionals researching the numerical analysis of continua
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From reader reviews:

Steven Tran:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Finite Elements of
Nonlinear Continua (Dover Civil and Mechanical Engineering) will make you to always be smarter. You can
feel more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that open or reading a
new book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best
book or acceptable book with you?

Mary Clark:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for us. The book Finite Elements of Nonlinear Continua (Dover
Civil and Mechanical Engineering) had been making you to know about other understanding and of course
you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The book Finite Elements of
Nonlinear Continua (Dover Civil and Mechanical Engineering) is not only giving you much more new
information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read
your guide. Try to make relationship using the book Finite Elements of Nonlinear Continua (Dover Civil and
Mechanical Engineering). You never feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

David Ashworth:

This book untitled Finite Elements of Nonlinear Continua (Dover Civil and Mechanical Engineering) to be
one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of
benefit in it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of
online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can
read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Sunny Lopez:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is Finite Elements of Nonlinear Continua (Dover Civil and Mechanical
Engineering). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in growing to be
precious person. By looking upwards and review this book you can get many advantages.
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