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A SUDDEN MARRIAGE

The stranger is huge--dark and forbidding. But to honor a deathbed promise to her foster father, Kailey
Hewett must marry Simon de Marchand, the kings sheriff, an intimidating mystery of a man. As they ride
away from her home and a;; she holds dear, Kailey wonders how she can keep her pledge to give this stern
man his hearts ease--but she vows to create a new family, no matter what it takes.

AN UNEXPECTED LOVE

This marriage was supposed to be final reparation for his part in her fathers long-ago death--nothing more.
But as Kaileys generous heart causes her to gather a family of endearing misfits around them, Simon
unexpectedly finds the walls of his own heart crumbling. By his own harsh sense of justice, though, Simon
can never allow himself to accept what he most wants, but believes he doesn't deserve--and the love Kailey
offers so freely becomes as much a torture as a pleasure. But as the small, lion-hearted woman whips the
huge, stunningly resistant man into an acceptance of love, he finally learns that mercy is as important as
justice--and love and forgiveness can heal all.
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From reader reviews:

David Eaton:

The book Her Secret Guardian can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So
why must we leave the best thing like a book Her Secret Guardian? Some of you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim which book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book Her Secret Guardian has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Shalon Fisk:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book Her Secret Guardian has been making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The guide Her Secret Guardian is not only giving you considerably more new
information but also to be your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own personal spend
time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship using the book Her Secret Guardian. You never truly feel
lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Emily Meredith:

You may get this Her Secret Guardian by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only through written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the
modern era including now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right
now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Dan Flood:

Some people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose typically the book Her Secret Guardian to make your current
reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially.
It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and go through it. Beside that the book Her
Secret Guardian can to be a newly purchased friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in doing what
must you're doing of their time.
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