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In this compelling memoir, Nokia's legendary CEO Jorma Ollila presents a riveting account of the inner
workings of the company that created the global mobile revolution. CEO from 1992 to 2006, Ollila led
Nokia from near catastrophe to become the world's leading mobile phone manufacturer. He built a company
where visionary thinking and courageous decisions were combined with exceptional creativity and first-rate
engineering, leading to phenomenal growth.

Follow Ollila's personal and professional journey, where you'll learn about the fine line between
stratospheric success and disastrous failure. His stories are filled with lessons about the nature of leadership,
the importance of shared values, and the need for strategic thinking.

Ollila offers a uniquely clear picture of life as a CEO, with many insights into how business is conducted at
the highest levels. He is especially upfront about working with his executive and management teams as well
as encounters with figures such as Bill Gates, Steve Jobs, and George Soros. He offers poignant as well as
illuminating stories of hair-raising risks and huge successes, but also of poor judgment and bad decision-
making.
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From reader reviews:

Deanna Stewart:

The guide untitled Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near Catastrophe to Global Success is the book
that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a
lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also could get the e-book of Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near Catastrophe to
Global Success from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Louis Hudson:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to try out look for book, may be the e-book untitled Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near
Catastrophe to Global Success can be excellent book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Glenn Herrera:

This Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near Catastrophe to Global Success is great publication for you
because the content which can be full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make
decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can
claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't
mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tough core information with beautiful delivering
sentences. Having Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near Catastrophe to Global Success in your hand
like keeping the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that offer
you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this really is good
reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?

Bethany Zuniga:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but novel and Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near
Catastrophe to Global Success or others sources were given information for you. After you know how the
truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
maybe students especially. Those guides are helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional case,
beside science publication, any other book likes Against All Odds: Leading Nokia from Near Catastrophe to



Global Success to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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