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"What's the big deal with manners anyway?" demands Princess Rosalind. Why do we always have to say
please and thank you? And who cares how we use a napkin?

Appalled by her rude behavior, the queen banishes Rosalind and her pet dragon Sparkler from the castle until
they can find Good Manners. Percival, the wizard, gives her a golden fork to help her on her search. They
face several challenges --however, not until the final test, do they discover the real secret behind Good
Manners.

Manners are more than etiquette rules. Studies show that children who practice gratitude have more focus,
energy and self-confidence. Good manners are the foundation for compassion, empathy and emotional
intelligence. Children and parents alike will love and learn from this story.

Recipient of the Mom's Choice Awards®--Gold
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Morrow:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to anyone is
you don't know what kind you should start with. This A Quest for Good Manners is our recommendation to
make you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Clorinda Combs:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their reader with their story or even their
experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about the information about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are many
kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their talent in writing, they
also doing some investigation before they write to their book. One of them is this A Quest for Good
Manners.

Edwina Hinkle:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, or playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to
reading a publication. The book A Quest for Good Manners it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a
lot of people who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book
from a smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book provides high quality.

Carl Johnson:

The book untitled A Quest for Good Manners contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains
the girl idea with easy method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not
necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new age of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read more your smart
phone, or model, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you
can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.
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