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Favor Johnson lives on a small farm in the hills of Vermont.  He keeps to himself, surrounded by dozens of
animals, chickens, geese, and his one constant friend, a hound named Hercules. Then one Christmas Eve
Hercules' life is saved by Favor's new neighbor, a doctor, and Favor's whole life -- as well as the life of
everyone in his village -- is changed forever. This delightful story of Favor Johnson, Hercules, Doctor
Jennings, and the mysterious house-to-house delivery of homemade fruit cakes on Christmas Eve is a heart-
warming tale of neighborliness and generosity in a Vermont village at Christmas.  It is also a tale of rescue,
of good and bad cooking, of friendship, and of giving presents at Christmas. A modern, and classic,
American Christmas folktale, Favor Johnson has been a favorite radio story for years and is published now
for the first time, brought to life by the wonderful watercolor illustrations of Bert Dodson. This book is their
second collaboration, the first being John and Tom, published in 2001. Willem Lange is a short-story writer,
commentator and host on Vermont Public Radio and New Hampshire Public Television. He also has a
weekly column in The Valley News, the major newspaper in the NH/VT Upper Valley area. In addition to
the Yuletide readings of his Christmas story, Favor Johnson, a staple on Public Radio for fifteen years, his
annual readings of Charles Dickens' A Christmas Carol -- on stage, on Vermont Public Radio, and on Armed
Forces Radio overseas -- have been popular since 1975. He lives with his wife in East Montpelier, Vermont.
Bert Dodson is the author and illustrator of the best-selling learn-to-draw classic Keys to Drawing as well as
the illustrator of over 80 children's books including a previous one with Willem Lange. He has also co-
written The Way Life Works with noted biologist Mahlon Hoagland. He lives in Bradford, Vermont.
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From reader reviews:

George Lehman:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by surrounding.
One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yeah, by reading a
guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other is high. For you personally who want
to start reading any book, we give you this specific Favor Johnson: A Christmas Stroy book as basic and
daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Dena Jacobs:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Favor Johnson: A Christmas Stroy book is readable by you who hate those
straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without
leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer connected with Favor
Johnson: A Christmas Stroy content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and
e-book are not different in the content material but it just different in the form of it. So , do you even now
thinking Favor Johnson: A Christmas Stroy is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Mary Hubbard:

The book untitled Favor Johnson: A Christmas Stroy is the publication that recommended to you to learn.
You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that article author use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration
when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You
also might get the e-book of Favor Johnson: A Christmas Stroy from the publisher to make you more enjoy
free time.

Melinda Walton:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Favor Johnson: A Christmas
Stroy which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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