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Located in the heart of the Andes, Potosí was arguably the most important urban center in the Western
Hemisphere during the colonial era. It was internationally famous for its abundant silver mines and
regionally infamous for its labor draft. Set in this context of opulence and oppression associated with the
silver trade, Trading Roles emphasizes daily life in the city’s streets, markets, and taverns. As Jane E.
Mangan shows, food and drink transactions emerged as the most common site of interaction for Potosinos of
different ethnic and class backgrounds. Within two decades of Potosí’s founding in the 1540s, the majority
of the city’s inhabitants no longer produced food or alcohol for themselves; they purchased these items.
Mangan presents a vibrant social history of colonial Potosí through an investigation of everyday commerce
during the city’s economic heyday, between the discovery of silver in 1545 and the waning of production in
the late seventeenth century.

Drawing on wills and dowries, judicial cases, town council records, and royal decrees, Mangan brings alive
the bustle of trade in Potosí. She examines quotidian economic transactions in light of social custom,
ethnicity, and gender, illuminating negotiations over vendor locations, kinship ties that sustained urban trade
through the course of silver booms and busts, and credit practices that developed to mitigate the pressures of
the market economy. Mangan argues that trade exchanges functioned as sites to negotiate identities within
this colonial multiethnic society. Throughout the study, she demonstrates how women and indigenous
peoples played essential roles in Potosí’s economy through the commercial transactions she describes so
vividly.
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From reader reviews:

Gayle Stalder:

The book Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban Economy in Colonial Potosí (Latin America
Otherwise) gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable far
more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem together with
your subject. If you can make studying a book Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban Economy in
Colonial Potosí (Latin America Otherwise) to become your habit, you can get much more advantages, like
add your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you
like wide open and read a publication Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban Economy in Colonial
Potosí (Latin America Otherwise). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or
others. So , how do you think about this book?

Freddie Straughter:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition info. Even you love Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban Economy in
Colonial Potosí (Latin America Otherwise), you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still
need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't obtain it, oh
come on its identified as reading friends.

Nancy Royals:

The book untitled Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban Economy in Colonial Potosí (Latin
America Otherwise) contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy approach.
The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the
idea. The book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of time of literary
works. You can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the
book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site
and order it. Have a nice examine.

Jesus Rhode:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Trading Roles: Gender, Ethnicity, and the Urban
Economy in Colonial Potosí (Latin America Otherwise) can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book
you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common
not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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