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America Unequal demonstrates how powerful economic forces have diminished the prospects of millions of
Americans and why "a rising tide no longer lifts all boats." Changes in the economy, public policies, and
family structure have contributed to slow growth in family incomes and rising economic inequality. Poverty
remains high because of an erosion of employment opportunities for less-skilled workers, not because of an
erosion of the work ethic; because of a failure of government to do more for the poor and the middle class,
not because of social programs.

There is nothing about a market economy, the authors say, that ensures that a rising standard of living will
reduce inequality. If a new technology, such as computerization, leads firms to hire more managers and
fewer typists, then the wages of lower-paid secretaries will decline and the wages of more affluent managers
will increase. Such technological changes as well as other economic changes, particularly the globalization
of markets, have had precisely this effect on the distribution of income in the United States.

America Unequal challenges the view, emphasized in the Republicans' "Contract with America," that
restraining government social spending and cutting welfare should be our top domestic priorities. Instead, it
proposes a set of policies that would reduce poverty by supplementing the earnings of low-wage workers and
increasing the employment prospects of the jobless. Such demand-side policies, Sheldon Danziger and Peter
Gottschalk argue, are essential for correcting a labor market that has been increasingly unable to absorb less-
skilled and less-experienced workers.
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From reader reviews:

Antoinette Hogg:

The actual book America Unequal (Russell Sage Foundation) has a lot associated with on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom
makes some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the point easily
after reading this book.

Tom Burkhardt:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite from that. 1
activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride on and
with addition of knowledge. Even you love America Unequal (Russell Sage Foundation), you are able to
enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

William Patterson:

You could spend your free time to read this book this book. This America Unequal (Russell Sage
Foundation) is simple to develop you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not
have much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to
read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when one buys this book.

Mary Wright:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but also novel and America Unequal (Russell Sage Foundation) or perhaps
others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel would
like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those
publications are helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other
book likes America Unequal (Russell Sage Foundation) to make your spare time more colorful. Many types
of book like here.
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