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The Oxford History of the United States is by far the most respected multi-volume history of our nation. The
series includes three Pulitzer Prize winners, two New York Times bestsellers, and winners of the Bancroft and
Parkman Prizes. Now, in the newest volume in the series, one of America's most esteemed historians,
Gordon S. Wood, offers a brilliant account of the early American Republic, ranging from 1789 and the
beginning of the national government to the end of the War of 1812.
As Wood reveals, the period was marked by tumultuous change in all aspects of American life--in politics,
society, economy, and culture. The men who founded the new government had high hopes for the future, but
few of their hopes and dreams worked out quite as they expected. They hated political parties but parties
nonetheless emerged. Some wanted the United States to become a great fiscal-military state like those of
Britain and France; others wanted the country to remain a rural agricultural state very different from the
European states. Instead, by 1815 the United States became something neither group anticipated. Many
leaders expected American culture to flourish and surpass that of Europe; instead it became popularized and
vulgarized. The leaders also hope to see the end of slavery; instead, despite the release of many slaves and
the end of slavery in the North, slavery was stronger in 1815 than it had been in 1789. Many wanted to avoid
entanglements with Europe, but instead the country became involved in Europe's wars and ended up waging
another war with the former mother country. Still, with a new generation emerging by 1815, most Americans
were confident and optimistic about the future of their country.
Named a New York Times Notable Book, Empire of Liberty offers a marvelous account of this pivotal era
when America took its first unsteady steps as a new and rapidly expanding nation.
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From reader reviews:

Katrina Frey:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
are really reading whatever they consider because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person
who don't like studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Empire of Liberty: A History of the Early Republic, 1789-1815
(Oxford History of the United States).

Sergio Kelley:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading practice give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on
what kind of book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want
truly feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Empire of
Liberty: A History of the Early Republic, 1789-1815 (Oxford History of the United States) is kind of
publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Michael Carr:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Empire of Liberty: A History of the
Early Republic, 1789-1815 (Oxford History of the United States) reserve written by well-known writer
whose to say well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written
with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your current hunger
then you still question Empire of Liberty: A History of the Early Republic, 1789-1815 (Oxford History of the
United States) as good book not simply by the cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can break
don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this particular!?
Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to one more
sixth sense.

Scott Hicks:

This Empire of Liberty: A History of the Early Republic, 1789-1815 (Oxford History of the United States) is
great book for you because the content that is full of information for you who else always deal with world
and still have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it details accurately using great
coordinate word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but tough core information
with lovely delivering sentences. Having Empire of Liberty: A History of the Early Republic, 1789-1815



(Oxford History of the United States) in your hand like having the world in your arm, info in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen moment
right but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still
doubt that will?
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