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There are no words large enough to encompass a generalization about the vastness of twentieth-century
Tokyo, but in this book Atsushi Azumi delves beneath the postwar facade of concrete and steel. He seeks
and finds a still flourishing heritage of traditional culture that has survived since the days when Tokyo was
the small seacoast town of Edo. Unforgettably illustrated by the photographs of Hiroshi Kaneko, family
customs, religious ceremonies, and ancient fairs are recorded throughout a Tokyo year of tradition and color.
The traditions of Tokyo cling tenaciously to life despite increasing modernization and the strong influence of
the West. Temples destroyed by earthquakes and war rise again with modern concrete buildings sheltering
the old festivals and customs. The casual visitor or even the long-time resident may imagine that the
traditions of the Edo era are only a pleasant memory, but Atsushi Azumi and Hiroshi Kaneko have
assembled fascinating evidence that the spirit of traditional Japan is winning the struggle for survival in the
world's greatest city.
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From reader reviews:

Teddy Mendoza:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Traditional Tokyo. All type
of book are you able to see on many methods. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

James Oliver:

The book untitled Traditional Tokyo is the e-book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality
of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language that creator use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, hence the
information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Traditional Tokyo
from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Loretta Faria:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic within the
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the book untitled Traditional Tokyo can be very good book to read. May be it
could be best activity to you.

Doris Griffin:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will
see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to you
personally is Traditional Tokyo this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world
now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage
of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some research when he makes this book.
Honestly, that is why this book suited all of you.
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