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When Dr. Meghan Weir first dons her scrubs and steps onto the floor of Children's Hospital Boston as a
newly minted resident, her head is packed with medical-school-textbook learning. She knows the ins and
outs of the human body, has memorized the correct way to perform hundreds of complicated procedures, and
can recite the symptoms of any number of diseases by rote. But none of that has truly prepared her for what
she is about to experience.
From the premature infants Dr. Weir is expected to care for on her very first day of residency to the
frustrating teenagers who visit the ER at three in the morning for head colds, each day brings with it new
challenges and new lessons. Dr. Weir learns that messiness, fear, and uncertainty live beneath the
professional exterior of the doctor's white coat. Yet, in addition to the hardships, the practice of medicine
comes with enormous rewards of joy, camaraderie, and the triumph of healing.
The three years of residency--when young doctors who have just graduated from medical school take on
their own patients for the first time--are grueling in any specialty. But there is a unique challenge to dealing
with patients too young to describe where it hurts, and it is not just having to handle their parents. In
"Between Expectations: Lessons from a Pediatric Residency," Dr. Weir takes readers into the nurseries,
ICUs, and inpatient rooms of one of the country's busiest hospitals for children, revealing a world many of us
never get to see. With candor and humility, she explores the many humbling lessons that all residents must
learn: that restraint is sometimes the right treatment option, no matter how much you want to act; that some
patients, even young teenagers, aren't interested in listening to the good advice that will make their lives
easier; that parents ultimately know their own children far better than their doctors ever will.
Dr. Weir's thoughtful prose reveals how exhaustion and doubt define the residency experience just as much
as confidence and action do. Yet the most important lesson that she learns through the months and years of
residency is that having a good day on the floor does not always mean that a patient goes home miraculously
healed--more often than not, success is about a steady, gradual discovery of strength. By observing the
children, the parents, and other hospital staff who painstakingly provide care each day, Dr. Weir finds herself
finally developing into the physician (and the parent) she hopes to become. These stories--sometimes funny,
sometimes haunting--expose the humanity that is so often obscured by the doctor's white coat.
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From reader reviews:

Thelma Brady:

What do you about book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have spare
time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have extra time? What did
you do? Everybody has many questions above. They must answer that question due to the fact just their can
do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from
on jardín de infancia until university need that Between Expectations: Lessons from a Pediatric Residency to
read.

Loren Parker:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and
learning books but if you want feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining like comic or novel.
The particular Between Expectations: Lessons from a Pediatric Residency is kind of reserve which is giving
the reader unpredictable experience.

Barbara Saddler:

This book untitled Between Expectations: Lessons from a Pediatric Residency to be one of several books
that will best seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it.
You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher
of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in
your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Tony Hogan:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Between Expectations: Lessons from a
Pediatric Residency publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can
be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still hesitation Between
Expectations: Lessons from a Pediatric Residency as good book not only by the cover but also by content.
This is one guide that can break don't assess book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to
listening to another sixth sense.
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