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The dream of flight is one of the oldest in human history. We read about it in ancient Greek mythology and
visualize it through Leonardo da Vinci's sketches of flying machines.

The Book of Flight traces the remarkable story of the pioneers, inventors, and daring pilots who turned that
dream into a reality. Based on the outstanding collections of the National Air and Space Museum, this
handsome book brings to life milestones in flight history: the development of ballooning; the earliest human
gliders; the Wright Brothers' first sustained flights; Charles Lindbergh's solo trip across the Atlantic; Amelia
Earhart's courageous flights; Chuck Yeager's blast through the sound barrier; the Apollo astronauts' first
steps onto the moon; and the building of the International Space Station.

Richly illustrated, this book takes you on an exciting journey through time. You'll watch early inventors at
work, thrill to the first air races and the dogfights of World War I and II, peer inside a flying boat of the
1930s, and witness the horrific explosion of the airship Hindenburg. You'll ride in the DC-3, marvel at the
technology of the stealth fighter, and experience life aboard the Space Shuttle. As you turn the pages you'll
meet barnstormers and ballonists, stunt flyers and flying aces, and rocket scientists and astronauts.

More than 350 photographs and illustrations portray the development of aviation and space flight. Diagrams
explain concepts such as jet propulsion and supersonic flight and depict the workings of rockets and other
devices. A comprehensive glossary provides easy-to-understand explanations of technical terms.

The National Air and Space Museum in Washington, DC, with more than eight million visitors annually, is
home to the world's most famous collection of historical aircraft, rockets, and space vehicles.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Harlow:

The book Book of Flight: The Smithsonian National Air and Space Museum can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a very important thing like a book Book
of Flight: The Smithsonian National Air and Space Museum? Several of you have a different opinion about
publication. But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now,
try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for each
other; you could share all of these. Book Book of Flight: The Smithsonian National Air and Space Museum
has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous
world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Joann Huertas:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly because just their
can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on jardín de infancia until university need this specific Book of Flight: The Smithsonian National
Air and Space Museum to read.

William Stewart:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How many people to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Book of Flight: The Smithsonian National
Air and Space Museum book because this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in
this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Gale Velez:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of guide
you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want really feel happy read
one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Book of Flight: The Smithsonian National
Air and Space Museum is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.
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